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<Information Economics and Decision Analysis (IEDA)> 

The Information Economics and Decision Analysis (IEDA) science initiative is designed to provide policy and decision 
makers with scientific knowledge and research findings, as well as to support policy and decision processes along with 
analyses and outcome measures, especially in the social and cognitive domains. Specifically, IEDA aims to investigate 
how economic agents make decisions and how these decisions interact and evolve under diverse conditions, enriching 
the interplay between domain-specific knowledge and cross-domain collaboration. 

The findings from this initiative can also be applied by researchers and practitioners to further strengthen efforts to 
understand and cope with the increasing complexity and uncertainty, which compels institutions and organisations to 
undertake a systemic approach to strategic decision-making to distribute data, information, and knowledge as actual 
business assets. This point concerns a broader issue that is relevant to information systems and economics: The 
intricacy of the subject matter is such that the quality and quantity of information required for a wide range of policy 
actions and programmes span various scales, from micro to macro. These actions and programs often share common 
sources of information, requiring advanced methodological approaches to evaluate their effectiveness critically. 

The key to adapting, developing, and thriving in the information age lies in a readiness to experiment and to change 
structurally: This also demands creativity in devising, designing, and implementing new ways to generate economic 
benefits from an organisation’s vast array of data and information assets. Thus IEDA examines how data and 
information move through and outside the context of various micro- and macroeconomic concepts, methods, and 
applications—both standard and non-standard—and what can be gleaned from cutting-edge research themes to improve 
the way information is effectively managed and leveraged. This naturally leads to experimentation and the development 
of new insights into the various ways data and information can generate economic value of different kinds, including 
how multiple approaches to economics and business analytics can increase the potential of information and realise value 
for organisations. 

In recognition of the above aims and scope and to enable an approach to the full spectrum of decision theory and the 
economy of knowledge with information production, distribution, and use, as well as the principles underlying business 
information systems and economics, IEDA 2024 seeks to represent how the socio-economic systems work, where they 
fail, and how decision-making affects the systems, their transformational challenges, and sustainability. On the one 
hand, indeed, information economics—or the economics of information—represents the institutional branch of 
microeconomics and the normative foundation of information modelling by examining how information and 
information systems affect both organisations and economies and economic decisions. On the other, the focus of IEDA 
is to develop operational decision-making methods, drawing on all aspects of decision and information theory, decision 
analysis, and behavioural decision theory with the ultimate objective of providing practical guidance for decision-
makers and problem-solvers. 

By fostering interdisciplinary dialogue among these fields, the economics of information and decision-making has 
provided new intellectual bases for branches of the profession that seemed sluggish and in need of reinvigoration (e.g., 
institutional economics) as well as appeared to lack a robust theoretical framework (e.g., accounting, finance, and 
corporate governance), while also helping to underscore the critical importance of working in these sub-fields and the 
need for their sustained development. One of the most encouraging findings from the latest edition of IEDA (2023) is 
its significant contribution to bridging the gap between theory and practice in information and decision analysis. It 
facilitates communication, knowledge exchange, and problem-solving among decision analysts in academia, business, 
and government. Merging theory with practical results, both empirical and experimental, remains a compelling 
challenge in contemporary social and cognitive sciences, necessitating further research to reduce the gap between 
decision analysis tools and their users. This is crucial for both single decision-maker situations and more complex 
scenarios involving heterogeneous decision-makers. Consequently, papers will contribute to these objectives and related 
goals using diverse methods and approaches. In this regard, possible topics and key messages from IEDA 2024 may 
include—but are not limited to—the following ones: 
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- Discussions of novel or existing procedures, processes, or algorithms for implementing decision analysis; 

- Computational evolutionary economics: Artificial intelligence, mathematical psychology, and cognitive science; 

- Local dynamics in decision-making: The evolution of preferences as a consequence of perceived alternatives; 

- Decision-making and information systems development: Conceptual framework and design; 

- Contributions of economic theory to the understanding of information and a knowledge-based economy; 

- Financial decision-making and information systems: From micro to macro business processes; 

- Informational imperfections in the markets, systemic crises and macroeconomic fluctuations; 

- Decision spaces evolving through experimentation: The business value of improved decision-making 

- Information, computation, and emergent complexity in a digital economy and society; 

- Multicriteria decision analysis (MCDA) methods and possible applications to support decision-making analysis; 

- Cognitive, organisational, economic, policy, and quantitative issues in applying decision analysis; 

- Information systems research exploring social artefacts: Theory and methodological approaches; 

- Decision support capabilities of enterprise content management systems: Theory and applications; 

- Data and information production, distribution, and storage: Dynamic algorithms and human-centric interaction; 

- Information systems for strategic decision-making: Data-driven decision-making methods; 

- Dominance-based soft set approach in decision-making analysis; 

- Information systems research exploring social artefacts: Approaches and methodologies; 

- Decision and information theories for production: Information architectures and systems for managing knowledge; 

- Innovative uses of information technology to perform decision analysis; 

- Statistics for business and information: Decision-making and analysis; 

- Decision support systems evolution: Framework, methodologies and research agenda; 

- Issues in applying decision analysis to real-world situations: Development and sustainability; 

- Performing big data analytics through the efficient use of algorithms, high-performance and out-of-core computing; 

- Machine learning, longitudinal and causal analyses using modelling approaches and computational techniques; 

- Predicting market shifts, identifying competitive innovation, and adjusting to economic changes; 

- Emerging digital ecosystems from combinations of data streams and smart communities: Research implications; 

- Other topics that further information economics, as well as the theory and practice of decision analysis.  

Nevertheless, any fundamental argument concerning the information economy and society will have to be supported 
and developed upon the foundations laid down by Turing, Tarski, Shannon, Wiener, von Neumann, Kolmogorov, and 
Simon, among several others. Papers submitted to IEDA may generally adhere to the intellectual foundations of 
information economics, decision theory, and decision analysis, as well as recognise the role that information economics 
plays in advancing economics, including contract theory and institutional economics. However, IEDA also welcomes 
original contributions that challenge the above research fields. For instance, papers may demonstrate how concepts, 
ideas, and methods from other fields—such as behavioural and evolutionary game theory, experimental economics, 
behavioural economics and finance, cognitive economics, or quantum decision theory) can enhance or overturn the 
theory or practice of decision analysis. IEDA also publishes papers that review and/or summarise important topics or 
advances relevant to information economists and decision analysts or that provide original historical, scholarly, or 
practical perspectives on these fields. In addition, this session/track encourages papers that promote the teaching of best 
practices, including state-of-the-art applications, case studies, and tutorial articles on decision analysis methods. 
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<Keywords: Information and economic analysis; Information and informational decisions; Information transmission, 
acquisition, and aggregations; Computation and information processing; Cognitive economics; Micro- and 
macroeconomic modelling approaches and evidence; Information, knowledge, and uncertainty; Quantum theory of 
computation and information; Algorithmic social science research; Value of information; Information asymmetry; 
Business information systems and their implications for managers, organisations, employees and other stakeholders; 
Decisions in economics and finance; Decision-making and problem solving; Multicriteria decision analysis; Decision 
analytic modeling; Decision support systems; Knowledge-based data analysis; Emerging digital asset ecosystems; 
Network effects; Digital business management, enterprise systems and business intelligence.> 
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